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FIGURES 

 

Fig. 1 | Requirements for epidemic control of COVID-19 using population-scale testing and 
self-quarantine. (A) An SIR model""  with 𝑅" = 	2.4 leads to infection of the majority of the 
population, with a massive peak of active infection that overwhelms the health care system. 
(B) With strong interventions that reduce 𝑅" to 0.95, many deaths are avoided. (C) Testing 
everyone simultaneously cuts all chains of transmission. (D) The required level of 
compliance (fraction of all individuals) for effective control of the epidemic, as a function of 
the strength of other interventions and assuming a test with 85% efficacy (fraction of future 
infections detected). With moderate social distancing, epidemic control can be achieved even 
with low levels of test compliance. 

 . CC-BY-ND 4.0 International licenseIt is made available under a 
 is the author/funder, who has granted medRxiv a license to display the preprint in perpetuity. (which was not certified by peer review)

The copyright holder for this preprint this version posted May 1, 2020. .https://doi.org/10.1101/2020.04.27.20078329doi: medRxiv preprint 



 

15 

 

Fig. 2 | Compartment models and requirements for suppression by testing. (A) Parameters for 
a standard SIR model. (B) Inequality that must be true to suppress transmission. For the 
epidemic to collapse, the weighted average of the natural reproduction number 𝑅" and the 
reproduction number in self-quarantine 𝑅! must be less than one. Here, 𝑝 represents the test 
true positive rate (fraction of all infectious individuals detected), and 𝑐 the rate of 
compliance. (C) Parameters for a SIR model with testing and a detected state. (D) 
Requirements for testing to collapse an epidemic in the SIR model with testing, expressed in 
terms of the testing rate 𝑡 required in a population where all individuals are susceptible, with 
inverse infectious interval 𝜆. (E) Parameters for the discrete, stochastic SEIR model on a 
social graph. Each compartment was modelled for every individual on the social graph. (F) 
Outcomes of ten simulation runs of the stochastic SEIR model on a social graph, showing 
total number of deaths as a function of the fraction tested every day, assuming compliance 
and true positive rate 𝑝𝑐 = 2/3.  
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Fig 3 | Scenario simulation using a stochastic network SEIR model. (A) Simulation of a 
population of 10,000 individuals, 100 of which are infected at the outset. Population-scale 
testing is implemented from day 20 (left), or not implemented (right). Lower panels show the 
same plots but zoomed in on the vertical (population) scale. (B) Simulation of a population of 
10,000 individuals, 100 of which are infected at the outset. Severe social distancing 
(lockdown) is applied after 20 days, and then lifted after 100 days. Population-scale testing is 
implemented after day 100 (left) or not implemented (right). In all panels, shaded colored 
regions indicate policy regimes, and the total number of dead individuals is indicated in the 
sub-panel titles. For both panels, the product of compliance and test efficacy was set to 𝑐𝑒 =
0.8 and the testing rate was set to 𝜏 = 1/7. 
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Supplemental Figure 1 | Successful testing strategies under the stochastic SEIR model on a 
social graph. Growth curves (daily new cases) showed that given 𝑐𝑝 = 2/3, testing at least 
every 11 days successfully flipped the sign of the exponential growth curve from day 20 
(when testing started), whereas testing every 13 days was insufficient. Red dashed curves, 
piecewise exponential fits for days 0 – 20, 20 – 100, and 100 – 250.  
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