














the observations within households of different sizes. The fit obtained using the model is 
much better than the fit obtained using a naïve model that ignores secondary infections within 
households (see Figure S2 in the Supplementary Material). 

 
 

 

Figure 6: Likelihood level curves for the parameters �Û, �Ü, and three values of �Ú�Ô�Ô. For 
smaller values of �Ú�Ô�Ô the maximal-likelihood estimates of parameters �Û and �Ü are larger. 
 
We performed sensitivity analysis to examine the effect of various assumptions on the results. 
These included sensitivity to the assumed generation-time distribution, the assumed age-
group of the index case in households in which there was some doubt regarding the index 
case’s age-group, and to the assumed observed duration of the epidemic in the households. In 
general, our results seem to be robust to reasonable variations in all of these attributes. Full 
description of the sensitivity analyses appears in the Supplementary Material. 
 
 

 
Figure 7: Best model fit to the observed data in the Bnei Brak data set, aggregated according 
to the household size (fit to households of size greater than or equal to 10 are not shown). 
 
 
 
Discussion 

Currently, one of the most significant unanswered questions about COVID-19 transmission 
relates to the role of children in the spread of infection. In this study we address this 
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knowledge gap with the aim of quantifying susceptibility and infectivity of children 
compared to adults.  

We fitted a stochastic age-of-infection type model, allowing us to take into account the 
generation-time distribution. Although the propagation of the disease within a household was 
not reported, a simulated likelihood approach enabled us to fit such a model using only 
aggregated data of infected individuals.  
 
The estimation results indicate that the role of children in the transmission of infection is less 
prominent than that of adults: children are less susceptible than adults (relative susceptibility 
45% [40%, 55%]), and their infectivity may be somewhat lower as well (relative infectivity 
85% [65%, 110%]). The data were more informative regarding the relative susceptibility of 
children than regarding their relative infectivity, as indicated by much wider confidence 
intervals for the relative infectivity in comparison to those for the relative susceptibility. Data 
containing more index cases in the children's group would provide more information about 
children's infectivity. In order to provide a full explanation for the fact that this dataset cannot 
provide a more accurate estimate of the relative infectivity of children, understanding the 
variance of the estimators is required, a task which is beyond the scope of this work and will 
be undertaken elsewhere.  
 
As we have noted in the Introduction, the fact that the fraction of children among the 
confirmed cases has been found to be low in many countries can be accounted for by two 
(nonexclusive) hypotheses: (1) Children display milder symptoms than adults when infected, 
so are less likely to be tested, (2) Children are less susceptible to infection than adults. 
Our results lend support to the second hypothesis and suggest that lower susceptibility of 
children to infection could indeed play a large role in explaining the epidemiological pattern 
noted.  
 
The result concerning the lower susceptibility of children raises the question of possible 
biological mechanisms that could account for such an effect. A recent study has found 
evidence suggesting the presence some residual immunity in people not previously exposed 
to SARS-CoV-2, in the form of SARS-CoV-2-reactive CD4+ T cells, attributed to circulating 
‘‘common cold’’ coronaviruses 21. It is possible that this form of partial protection is more 
common in children since infection rates with seasonal coronaviruses are higher in children 
22. The fact that in our data set, children under the age of one have higher rates of infection 
with SARS-CoV-2 compared to children between one and four, is consistent with the 
hypothesis that partial immunity to SARS-CoV-2 could be related to past exposure to 
seasonal coronaviruses. 
 
We note that while our estimates of children's susceptibility and infectivity are lower than 
those of adults within a household, it is important to bear in mind that their role in the spread 
of COVID-19 outside the household is also affected by different contact patterns and 
hygienic habits.  
 
Summarizing, our findings shed light on empirical observations gathered worldwide 
regarding the role of children in the spread of disease, and can contribute to better modelling 
of the epidemic dynamics, devising control measures and guiding public health policy. Our 
methodology can be applied to other household studies. In particular, it could be employed to 
the results of serological tests in households, where all members of the households are tested. 
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